
Freedom of Information Disclosure Log – July 

2025 – December 2025 

Saltash Town Council is committed to being open and transparent. As part of our 

obligations under the Freedom of Information, responses to requests will be 

published here.  This is also known as the disclosure log. 

Environmental Information Regulations (EIR) applications will also be included here. 

 

FOI – Confirmation requested for when Saltash Town Council stopped the traditional 

Civic Service of Remembrance being held between the four main Saltash Churches. 

 

Requested reference number: 2025-08-01 

Date of response: 15.10.2025 

Summary of request: 

1. To provide information and the minute(s) confirming when Saltash Town 

Council stopped the traditional Civic Service of Remembrance being held 

between the four main Saltash Churches on a rota basis. 

 

2. A copy of the original report that was due to be received by Full Council 

posted on the 01.08 2025 requesting they agree to the Wesley Church 

hosting the Town Council Civic Service of Remembrance for the next four 

years. 

 

Response: 

1. Saltash Town Council do not hold information regarding point one, as a 

decision to stop holding remembrance on a rota basis has never been made. 

 

2. Saltash Town Council do not hold information on point two as the original 

report was modified into a later version and that later version is the only 

version stored. 
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